COOKEVILLE CITY COUNCIL
REGULAR MEETING
OCTOBER 20, 2005
6:00 P.M.

The Council of the City of Cookeville met in regular session on Thursday,
October 20, 2005, at 6:00 p.m., in the Municipal Building, 45 East Broad Street.
Invocation was given by Mayor Womack. Pledge of Allegiance was led by Mayor
Womack. Mayor Womack then called the meeting to order and asked the Clerk to call
the roll. Present and answering roll call were:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

Also present: Jim Shipley, City Manager; Cathy McClain, City Clerk and Mike
O’Mara, City Attorney.

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF
AGENDA AS PRESENTED

Councilman Sallee made a motion, seconded by Councilman Shelton, to amend
the agenda by adding items — recognize volunteer of the month; recognize Cookeville/
Putnam County Hurricane Relief Center volunteers; and budget billing presentation.
Upon call for a vote, the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls
The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

RECOGNIZE VOLUNTEER
OF THE MONTH

PROCLAMATION

Whereas: Mr. Pat Moran is being honored as
September’s Volunteer of the Month” for his community
service and volunteer spirit; and

Whereas: Pat is a very deserving and vital member of
our community and goes above and beyond in service to our
Police Department; and

Whereas: Mr, Moran has volunteered to work with
our Soap Box Derby, Fall Fun Fest, Citizens Police Academy
Alumni, National Night Out Against Crime, Local Youth
Baseball, Trinity Assembly Church’s Media Department
and the Bicyele Criterion Race; and

Whereas: Pat is a person you can call at anytime and
he will do what he can to help — he is a very special caring
man with heart of gold.

Now, therefore, 1, Dr. Charles Womack, Mayor of the
City of Cookeville, do hereby proclaim a sense of profound
appreciation to Pat Moran for his volunteerism and service
to this community and commend Mr. Moran as Cookeville's
Volunteer of the Month.

This 20" day of October, 2005.

Mayor Charles T. Womack, M.D.
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RECOGNIZE COOKEVILLE/
PUTNAM COUNTY
HURRICANE RELIEF
CENTER VOLUNTEERS

Councilman Davis recognized the following volunteers: Janet Lakin, Carmen
Blake, Edith Dodd, Patricia Allen, Alice Truitt, Bill & Shirley Klug, Nadine Xander &
Sherry Heussner. Mayor Womack presented them with a certificate & key to the city.

The Council also thanked the Chamber of Commerce and Jack & Johnny Stites
for their donations.

OLD BUSINESS:

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF
MINUTES OF COUNCIL
MEETING HELD ON
OCTOBER 6, 2005

Councilman Sallee made a motion to dispense with the reading of the minutes and
approve said minutes as submitted. The motion was seconded by Councilman Shelton.
Upon call for a vote, the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

CONSIDER ON SECOND AND
FINAL READING ORDINANCE
#005-09-20, REZONING 1821
FORREST ROAD FROM RS-15
(SINGLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL)
TO RS-10 (SINGLE-FAMILY
RESIDENTIAL)

Councilman Sallee made a motion, seconded by Councilman Shelton, to approve
on second and final reading Ordinance #005-09-20. Upon call for a vote, the following
voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton
ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.
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NEW BUSINESS:

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF
AGREEMENT TO ESTABLISH
THE PUTNAM COUNTY RAIL
TRAIL AUTHORITY

Suzanne Bussell, local horseback rider, requested allowing horses to be a part of
the trail.

Monterey Mayor Wiggins, George Halford, President/CEO of Chamber of
Commerce, and Keith Lilly spoke in support of this project.

Mayor Womack made a motion, seconded by Councilman Sallee, to approve the
Putnam County Rail Trail Authority Agreement as amended by adding to paragraph #5 —
the tenth member shall be appointed by the Upper Cumberland Heritage Association.
Upon call for a vote, the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls
The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF
CROUCH ENGINEERING
AS THE FIRM FOR THE
RAIL TRAIL PROJECT
AND AUTHORIZE THE
CITY MANAGER TO
BEGIN CONTRACT
NEGOTIATIONS

Evaluation of § of Qualificati
Ruils with Trails Project

| TCrouch Ned |
Criteria | Sehaffer

[Sound working knowledge of railrosd operations | 10| 75

| and engineering i | |
Expericnce in working with TDOT as wellas |9 i 71

| other federal and state funding agencies |

S | |
| iroad History and Fistory of Punian Courty |10 | g |

| Horiculture/Environmental lssues B | B

Civil Site Design/Parking Design/Water and | 10 K3
| sewer Design |

| TOTAL

Recommended Company Crouch Engiseesing
iy

Councilman Davis made a motion, seconded by Councilman Sallee, to approve
Crouch Engineering for the Rail Trail Project and authorize the City Manager to begin
contract negotiations. Upon call for a vote, the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton
ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.
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CONSIDER APPROVAL OF
EMERGENCY PURCHASE
OF TWO (2) PACKING
CYLINDERS FOR
SANITATION TRUCK

#353 (FRONT LOAD)

VISIT DUR WEB SITE @ HOLTZINDUSTRIES. COM

Invaice
HOLTZ INDUSTRIES IMC Invoice : 199073
LEGEND VALLEY PRODUCTS Customer: 28501
2@® 5 TERRACE COURT Inv Date:id, 34,05
NEWARK DHID 43055 Page Mum: 1
PH 74@-386-4002 FX 740-366-0771 Order : 179537
Bill=to: Ship-to:
CITY OF CODHEVILLE CITY OF COOKVILLE
P O BOX 9398 CITY GARAGE
COOKEVILLE TH TEB WHITSON AVE
CODKVILLE TN
28503-9938
ustomer PD Nusber:l1S@-331
ihip Date :Drp:Resle:Terss 18hip Via :Elspr Num:Due Date |Di|count Date
@.04.85 : N : N NET 30 sRAL a2 111.03.05 :10.24.
Ity Ordered :0ty Shipped:Item Numbar tlnit 1 Extended
1@ty Backord:Description Price E Amaount
2. oo 2,08 EZ-70-01730
2.0 CYLIMDER KEZ167DA**#» 2750, 00 S5e9. en

Freistt s
Tl F s s

Councilman Sallee made a motion, seconded by Councilman Shelton, to approve
the emergency purchase of two (2) packing cylinders as requested. Upon call for a vote,
the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls
The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.
CONSIDER AWARDING BID FOR

USED PICKUP TRUCK - PUBLIC
WORKS DEPARTMENT

—
Bob Johnson Auto Sales
TB01 N Washington Ave,, Cookeiie, TH 38501 - Phone-231-528.3211 : Faxgd1-828.3221
BUYER'S ORDER AND DISCLOSURE AGREEMENT
NAME: Cly Of Cookewile ADDRESS: W Broad St
CITY: Coskevile o E:
el COUNTY punam | STATE: TH 2P 3msot Tel: (931)526-9651 / {331)526-8581
(heceinafter called "Buyer’), 87d  Bob Johnson Aulo Sales + hereinafiar called “Saller” o heveby agres as bollows:
Seflor salls ko Buyer, he goods ow, with all ar hereafter added 1o them, upan the terms stated below and Buyer
accepts defivary 52 of Mis date and has examined the mammmﬂmumahg&mmls ond
Bee | Swock# | Year | Maks Model |Bndy8|ybfcdn( | | Vahicle idanti Kumbs
| | o Misageor | ©VIN
USED 0220 2001 | FORD .F 150 | Pickug Black |m|.| FTREOSWEINADISAT

'l'humueldmlsmurmmnysELLERub.(mmnmdallmammmbmmmd&LLER provide EEnGs,
Buyer will have 1o purchese insurance for this vehicle. doesnal s fype of

Deseription of Trade-in: ’ | {1 Price of Vabic $11,896.50
Year NA Make: N {2) Trade-In Allawance (-}. . $0.00
VNG NA (3) Trade Diffarence [+). . . $0.00
onTeodo i A :ﬂﬂocwmn!mhyruﬂmnla]...... 0,00

o ) Taxable Amt (1+4- Trade-In Price|
T sbove irade-in is guaranteed io be free and cear of all lans and (%) Taxal (1+4-Trade-in Price)..... §11,096.50
encumbrances except {6) Warranty (Taxed as Singla tem) ., .. ... BUA,
{7} Insurance [T

(B Sabes Tax...........0cooinnnn..,
T oy :-:
NiA {10) Business Tax, . $0.00
{11) Tisa & Licansa. . $0.00
Seder: By__ ; Date: {12) Total Cash Price. . ..............., $11.996.50
E B . (13) Cash Payment. .. .............., 5t|m.g}

‘No Warranty is incuded" . .

L) {14) Amount to be Financed (12-1:3‘_! ...... ) $0.00

&rﬁthhpiylnrumla snuu-nnn-mmuphqm“mmummmm
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Councilman Sallee made a motion, seconded by Councilman Davis, to approve
the purchase of one (1) used pickup truck as requested. Upon call for a vote, the

following voted aye:

ABSENT:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

CONSIDER AWARDING BID FOR
FURNACE & A/C UNITS - POLICE

DEPARTMENT

DATE OF BID OPENING

BID TABUIL

CITY OF COOKEVILLE
ATION SCHEDULFE

nil AJC Units

HIDS OPENED BY: Li
BIDS WITNESSED BY: Se 2 You
DEPARTMENT: Police
T3 458, |
IEE |
|
| |
| |
| |
WE, THE UNDERSIGNED, DO HEREBY RECOMMEND THE BID FROM ___ Johnstone Supply
BE AW _-\|c|>_unhn5 THE FOLLOWING REASON—Jou TUTE T — .
i ,_.-,J’___.y-- ) — — o
b X Ll o _E}d\'-_.-\m..k e
A ._I;gﬁrﬂﬁ’.ﬂﬂ]). DEP \.|<|{3|1'-.\| HEAD BUDGET AVAILABILITY: FINANCE DIRECTOR
i \ S —
# S
APPROVED: BT MANAGER

Councilman Davis made a motion, seconded by Councilman Shelton, to award
the furnace & A/C unit bid as recommended. Upon call for a vote, the following voted

aye:

ABSENT:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

CONSIDER AWARDING BIDS FOR
CAB & CHASSIS, AERIAL BUCKET
& TRANSFORMERS - ELECTRIC
DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF COOKEVILLE
ELECTRIC DEPT.
BID TABULATION SCHEDULE
BID NOTICE # 05090701

DATE OF BID OPENING: 9/29/2005 TIME: 2:00 PM CST
BIDS OPENED BY: wood
BIDS WITNESSED BY: Seott Torrence

DEPARTMENT:
2006 Year Model
BIDDERS Cab&Chassis
QTY 1

Neely Coble Freightliner $ 49,337.00
Heritage Ford No Bid
Landmark Internaticnal § 50.950.10
‘WE, THE UNDERSIGNED DO HEREBY RECOMMEND THE BID FROM Neely Coble Freightliner
BE AWARDED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASON: low bid meeting spees. /\ﬂ

ED: DEPT. HEAD

APPROVAL: M GER
CITY OF COOKEVILLE
ELECTRIC DEFT.
BID TABULATION SCHEDULE
BID NOTICE # 08090702

DATE UF BID OPENING: 9292005 TIME: 2: 30 M CST

BIDS OPENED BY: Glenn Greenwood

RIDS WITNESSED BY: Carlfaney

DEPARTMENT:

T Aanal
BIDDERS Bucket
QTY]

|CLG. Hughss S 7180800
Terex No Bid
Altec $ 71,042.00

‘WE, THE UNDERSIGNED DO HEREBY RECOMM

) THE BID FROM Alree

BE AWARDI /D'f?ll THE FOLLOWING REASON: low bid meeting specs.

CITY OF COOKEVILLE
ELECTRIC DEFT.
BID TABULATION SCHEDULE
RID NOTICE ¥ 05092101

DATE OF BID OPENING: 10/5/2005 TIME: 2:00 PM CST
BIDS OPENED BY: Clenn Coreenwood
BIDS WITNESSED BY: Tirian Bohanson
DEPARTMENT: Eleetric
itam 1 item 3 itwm 3 itarm 4
=0 Fova Pad. 75 Kva Pad 75 Fova 3phase 100 Kva Pad
BIDDERS Transformer Transtormar Transformers E Tr
aTy. &lenvaluate cost Blevaluale cost 1|evaluate cost
§ 120400 $ 156800 § 377200 S 1.804.00
Stuart | 3 4605005 228245)5 940800 (% 301231 372200 |§ 595552 (% 360B00|S 365380
Hughes Supply (Pauwels) No Bid Na Bid No Bid Na Bid 3621.00 |5 581722 Mo Bid Neo B
T.360.00 1.740.00 LN ¥ 210500
Hughes SUEEI: 1Canlra| Malonay) SES600|5 245318 1044000 (£ 312882 57320015 B09257 |5 420800)% 3.880.10
T738.00 | TA05.00 3.644.00 | 3 1301
[Power Supply 455600 [§ 212047 897000 |§ 283713 (5 1844003 588143 |5 380200 |§ 366747
TE1G00 | 71000 L)LY T IR
Wasca S 47800 |5 282384 1% 10820005 3.213.84|% 52260018 75433018 471000(% 3
5 1,209.00 ¥ 1.580.00 § 187200 |
Harris Electric Supply 5 BO7E00|S 2382683 95340008 301467| NoBd NoBd |$ 374400[5 358433
Aams 21, 2 4 e 3
WE, THE UNDERSIGNED [0 HERERY RECOMMENT THE RID FROM Power Supply Hughes Supply (Pauweh)

BE AWARDED FDR}IJ!I: FOLLOWING REASON: low evalusted bid meeting spees.
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Councilman Sallee made a motion, seconded by Councilman Shelton, to award
the Electric Department bids as recommended. Upon call for a vote, the following voted
aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls
The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

BUDGET BILLING
PRESENTATION

Jim Shipley, City Manager, explained that budget utility billing means even pay
billing system (enrollment period is in May). He stated that due to an interest in
enrolling, they would open enrollment in November & estimate by an increase of 150%
projected. The November enrollments will settle in May.

Mayor Womack recognized Dr. Earl Hutchison & his TTU Journalism Class, and
Joel Cowan, Putnam County Commissioner.

HEARING OF CITIZENS AND/OR DELEGATIONS:

Dave Ohara, owner of property & Brandy Newbower, resident on Garrett Avenue,
expressed concerns about traffic/indecent acts at a near by alcohol & drug rehabilitation
center in this area.

James Mills, City Planner, explained to the Council that the Board of Zoning
Appeals denied the request from a for-profit corporation & Codes Department told them
to vacate the premises (previously a Pacesetters House). Mike O’Mara, City Attorney, is
further studying to see if this use is legal (same use as Pacesetters) in this area.

There being no further business to discuss, Councilman Davis made a motion,
seconded by Councilman Sallee, to adjourn the meeting at 6:58 p.m. Upon call for a
vote, the following voted aye:

Mayor Charles Womack
Councilman Jean Davis
Councilman Sam Sallee
Councilman Ricky Shelton

ABSENT: Vice-Mayor Steve Qualls

The City Clerk announced that the motion carried.

Charles Womack, Mayor

ATTEST:

Cathy McClain, City Clerk
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